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INTRODUCTION
Plaintiff Dr. Justin H. Phillips (“Dr. Phillips” or “Plaintiff”’), by his attorneys, respectfully

submits this Memorandum of Law in support of his Motion for Attorneys’ Fees and Costs
pursuant to the Freedom of Information Act (“FOIA”), 5 U.S.C. § 552 et seq. Plaintiff brought
this action to compel Defendant United States Bureau of the Census (“Census Bureau” or
“Bureau”) to respond to Plaintiff’s FOIA request (“Request”) and to produce two data files
covered by the Request. The Bureau initially denied the Request. However, in response to this
litigation, the Bureau voluntarily released a version of one of the two files and consented to a
court order requiring it to release a version of the second file, which the Bureau subsequently
did.

FOIA provides for an award of reasonable attorneys’ fees and expenses to a plaintiff who
has “substantially prevailed.” 5 U.S.C. § 552(a)(4)(E)(i). Plaintiff’s attorneys amassed
$94,552.13 in legal fees over the course of litigation. Dr. Phillips and his attorneys have also
expended $649.70 in costs without reimbursement during this litigation.

Plaintiff substantially prevailed in his litigation against Defendant by obtaining complete
relief through a judicial order and a voluntary change in position by the Census Bureau. Plaintiff
is eligible for and entitled to an award of attorneys’ fees and expenses. Plaintiff therefore seeks
reasonable attorneys’ fees in the amount of $94,552.13 and reasonable expenses in the amount of
$649.70.

FACTUAL BACKGROUND
I Dr. Phillips’s FOIA Request

Dr. Justin H. Phillips is a Professor of Political Science and Chair of the Department at
Columbia University. Compl. § 8, ECF No. 1. Dr. Phillips’s academic research relies on census

data, including data about geographic units below the state level, to make accurate inferences
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about the population. On July 7, 2022, Dr. Phillips submitted the Request to the Census Bureau,
seeking (1) the privacy protected noisy measurements file for the 2020 Census (“2020 NMF”),
and (2) the privacy protected noisy measurements file demonstration data pulled from the 2010
Census (“2010 NMF,” and together with the 2020 NMF, the “NMFs”). Id. q 41. Plaintiff’s
request was approved for expedited processing. Answer 9 6, ECF No. 12.

II. The Bureau’s Delay, About Face, and Production of the Requested Files

Despite granting Dr. Phillips’ request for expedited processing, it took 133 days and the
filing of this lawsuit for the Bureau to respond to Dr. Phillips’ Request. Stipulation and Order of
Dismissal at 1 (Apr. 10, 2023), ECF No. 20 (hereinafter “Stip and Order”). FOIA obligated the
Bureau to decide on Plaintiff’s request within twenty business days and to immediately inform
him of the decision. 5 U.S.C. § 552(a)(6)(A)(i). The Bureau failed to comply with this obligation
or invoke any available extensions contemplated by FOIA. Even if the Bureau had invoked all
extensions, it would have been obligated to decide within forty business days, which it also
failed to do. 5 U.S.C. § 552(a)(6)(B).

To remedy the Bureau’s failure to comply with applicable time limit provisions under
FOIA, Plaintiff filed this action on October 31, 2022, seeking to compel the Bureau to issue a
determination on the Request and to release the responsive records. See Compl.

On December 1, 2022—after this litigation commenced, and almost five months after the
Request—Bureau finally issued its initial determination letter, denying the Request. The
determination letter stated that the Bureau had conducted a search for the 2010 NMF
Demonstration Data, but those data had been destroyed. See Stip. and Order at 2. The
determination letter also informed Plaintiff that the Bureau was withholding the 2020

Redistricting NMF, claiming it was exempt from disclosure under FOIA Exemption 3, 5 U.S.C.
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§ 552(b)(3), because its release was purportedly prohibited by the Census Act, 13 U.S.C.
§ 9(a)(2). See Stip. and Order at 2.

Following this denial of the Request, the Court convened a telephonic case management
conference on December 20, 2022. The Court heard argument regarding whether to allow
discovery in advance of the deadline for the Bureau’s motion for summary judgment. At the
conclusion of the conference, the Court denied Dr. Phillips’s request for pre-summary-judgment
discovery, without prejudice to any subsequent request to take discovery after the initial round of
summary judgment briefing. The Court also set a briefing schedule for the Bureau’s anticipated
summary judgment motion, with the Bureau’s opening brief due February 1, 2023, and
Plaintiff’s responsive papers due February 15, 2023. See Minute Entry (Dec. 20, 2022), as am.
by Minute Entry (Jan. 9, 2023).

After the case management conference, Plaintiff’s counsel began diligently working on
Plaintiff’s opposition to the Bureau’s anticipated motion for summary judgment. However, as the
Bureau’s deadline to move for summary judgment approached, the Bureau began voluntarily
providing the very relief Plaintiff sought. On January 18, 2023, the Bureau’s Data Stewardship
Executive Policy Committee (“DSEP”) approved the development and release of a newly created
2010 Demonstration Data NMF. The Bureau published the 2010 Demonstration Data NMF on
April 3, 2023. Stip. and Order at 3.

On January 25, 2023, the Bureau’s counsel informed Plaintiff that at an upcoming
meeting, DSEP would assess whether the 2020 NMF was in fact suitable for public release, thus
in practice reassessing the Bureau’s assertion that the file was exempt from disclosure under
Exemption 3. In light of this upcoming meeting, the parties stipulated to, and the Court granted,

an extension of the deadline for all opening summary judgment motions until April 10, 2023.
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Minute Entry (Jan. 26, 2023). After this modification to the schedule, Plaintiff continued
working on summary judgment briefing in the event that the Bureau refused to release the 2020
NMF or refused to do so within a reasonable timeframe.

On March 27, 2023, the Bureau authorized the public release of the 2020 NMF. Stip. and
Order at 3. The parties then entered into settlement discussions to resolve this action by setting a
stipulated, court-ordered deadline for the release of the 2020 NMF.

On April 10, 2023, the Court entered a Stipulation and Order of Dismissal requiring the
Census Bureau, no later than August 23, 2023, to either (1) publish the 2020 NMF in the form of
a “Research Data Product” that the Bureau planned to create, or (2) provide Plaintiff “an
unsupported file containing” the 2020 NMF. Stip and Order at 4.

Finally, on June 15, 2023—almost one year after Plaintiff submitted his FOIA Request,
and after burdening this Court and Plaintiff with the need for this litigation—the Bureau publicly
released the 2020 NMF as a Research Data Product. Thus, the final result of Dr. Phillips’s FOIA
Request and this litigation is that (1) a recreated version of the 2010 NMF was publicly released
on January 18, 2023, and (2) the 2020 NMF was released on June 15, 2023.

ARGUMENT

FOIA’s fee-shifting provision allows courts to “assess against the United States
reasonable attorneys’ fees and other costs reasonably incurred in any case under this section in
which the complainant has substantially prevailed.” 5 U.S.C. § 552(a)(4)(E)(ii). Courts evaluate
fee applications through a three-step process. N.Y. Times Co. v. Cent. Intel. Agency, 251 F. Supp.
3d 710, 713 (S.D.N.Y. 2017). First, plaintiffs must demonstrate their eligibility for attorneys’
fees and litigation costs. /d. Second, they must show that they are entitled to such fees and costs.
Id. Once the plaintiff has established that both eligibility and entitlement to fees and costs, the

court determines whether the fees and costs are “‘presumptively reasonable’ under the lodestar
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approach generally applied to fee applications in the Second Circuit.” Id. (citing Simmons v.
N.Y.C. Transit Auth., 575 F.3d 170, 174 (2d Cir. 2009)). Here, Plaintiff meets both threshold
standards, and the requested fees are reasonable.

I Plaintiff’s Attorneys are Eligible for and Entitled to Fees and Costs

a. Plaintiff is eligible for attorneys’ fees because he substantially prevailed in the
litigation by obtaining a judicial order in his favor and by a voluntary change in
position by the Census Bureau.

To satisfy the first step of FOIA’s fee-shifting analysis, a plaintiff must demonstrate
eligibility by showing they have “substantially prevailed” in their lawsuit. See Pietrangelo v.
U.S. Army, 568 F.3d 341, 343 (2d Cir. 2009) (per curiam) (quoting 5 U.S.C. § 552(a)(4)(E)(1)). A
complainant has substantially prevailed if they obtain judicial relief through “(I) a judicial order
... or (I) a voluntary or unilateral change in position by the agency, if the complainant’s claim
is not insubstantial.” 5 U.S.C. § 552(a)(4)(E)(ii) (emphasis added). Here, Plaintiff has
substantially prevailed under either standard.

Relief through a judicial order applies when there is a “judicially sanctioned change in
the legal relationship between the parties” awarding some relief to the plaintiff. Am. Oversight v.
U.S. Dep’t of Justice, 375 F. Supp. 3d 50, 61 (D.D.C. 2019); accord Report and
Recommendation, Wilson v. Fed. Bureau of Investigation, No. 1:20-cv-10324, 2022 U.S. Dist.
LEXIS 188389, at *8 (S.D.N.Y. Oct. 14, 2022). A stipulated order directing the agency to
produce any documents by a date certain fulfills this change in the legal relationship. See Davy v.
Cent. Intel. Agency, 456 F.3d 162, 165-67 (D.C. Cir. 2006); see also Jud. Watch, Inc. v. Fed.
Bureau of Investigation, 522 F.3d 364, 367-68 (D.C. Cir. 2008) (finding no functional difference
between a joint stipulation and a settlement agreement enforced through consent decree).

This Court’s Stipulation and Order of Dismissal required the Bureau to produce the 2020

NMF as either a Research Data Product or an unsupported file by August 23, 2023. Stip and
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Order at 4. The stipulation changed the legal relationship between Plaintiff and the Bureau by
ensuring the documents sought in Plaintiff’s Request would be obtained. Had the Census Bureau
failed to release the file in accordance with the Stipulation and Order, the Bureau would have
faced consequences including an order of contempt. See Jud. Watch, 522 F.3d at 367-68, 370
(finding judicially sanctioned change in a legal relationship where joint stipulation made FBI
“subject to contempt” if it failed to make timely disclosure). Therefore, by obtaining the
Stipulation and Order of Dismissal from this Court, Plaintiff substantially prevailed and is
eligible for attorneys’ fees.

Plaintiff also obtained relief through a voluntary change in position when the Census
Bureau publicly released both the 2020 NMF and a new version of the 2010 NMF, the original
version of which had been deleted. A voluntary change in position occurs when “the institution
and prosecution of the litigation cause[d] the agency to release the documents obtained.” Grand
Canyon Trust v. Bernardt, 947 F.3d 94, 97 (D.C. Cir. 2020) (per curiam) (quoting Church of
Scientology v. Harris, 653 F.2d 584, 587 (D.C. Cir. 1981)). A plaintiff must show that it is more
probable than not that the government would not have released the requested records without
their suit. /d. (quoting Pub. Citizen Health Res. Grp. v. Young, 909 F.2d 546, 550 (D.C. Cir.
1990)). Courts have found that litigation was the catalyst to agency compliance with FOIA
obligations based on evidence that the agency was unresponsive to the FOIA request before
litigation. See Elec. Priv. Info. Ctr. v. U. S. Dep’t of Homeland Sec., 811 F. Supp. 2d 216, 221-22
(D.D.C. 2011) (awarding attorneys’ fees where a lawsuit was filed following six months of

agency unresponsiveness post-FOIA request).
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Here, Plaintiff's FOIA Request went unaddressed for 133 days prior to this suit’s filing.!
Such an extensive waiting period, despite Plaintiff’s request being granted expedited review,
again indicates that the Bureau would not have released the data unless this lawsuit was pursued.
Moreover, when the Bureau eventually issued its final determination on December 1, 2022, it
initially denied release of both NMFs, stating that the 2010 NMF was unreleasable due to
destruction and that the 2020 NMF was exempt from release based on a legal theory relying on
FOIA Exemption 3 and the Census Act. The Bureau abandoned these flimsy positions once
faced with the prospect of having to defend them in summary judgment briefing.

It was only after continued prosecution of this FOIA action, and with the pressure of an
impending deadline to move for summary judgment, that the Bureau decided to recreate and
release a new version of the 2010 NMF and reversed its decision to not release the 2020 NMF,
abandoning its prior assertion that the material was exempt from disclosure under FOIA
Exemption 3. Stip and Order at 3-5. The Census Bureau’s public release of both NMFs is a direct
result of Plaintiff’s prosecution of this litigation.

The Bureau’s initial denial of Plaintiff’s request for the 2020 NMF based on an
unsupported exemption theory, following its public release of this data, is the exact scenario
Congress intended to avoid by amending the FOIA fee-shifting regime to include the catalyst
approach to fee eligibility. Specifically, “Congress intended this amendment to prevent federal
agencies from denying meritorious FOIA requests, only to voluntarily comply with a request on

the eve of trial to avoid liability for litigation costs.” Warren v. Colvin, 744 F.3d 841, 845 (2d

! The Bureau sent an interim clarification letter to counsel for Plaintiff on November 17, 2022—
133 days after the FOIA request was filed (but only 18 days after Plaintiff filed his Complaint).
Stip. and Order at 1-2. The Bureau did not issue its final determination in response to the FOIA
Request until December 1, 2023—147 days after the FOIA Request was filed. /d.
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Cir. 2014) (per curiam). Here, the Bureau’s subsequent data release undercut its prior claim of
exemption and showed that Plaintiff’s Request had merit. Awarding fees and costs ensures
Plaintiff’s attorneys are fairly compensated for the time necessarily expended in ensuring the
Census Bureau would fulfill its FOIA obligations.

b. Plaintiff is entitled to fees because the Pietrangelo factors weigh in his favor.

In the second step of the FOIA’s fee-shifting analysis, courts apply a four-factor test to
determine whether a plaintiff is entitled to fees and costs. Pietrangelo, 568 F.3d at 343. A court
weighs “(1) the public benefit derived from the case; (2) the commercial benefit to the plaintiff;
(3) the nature of the plaintiff’s interest in the records; and (4) whether the Government had a
reasonable basis for withholding requested information.” /d. None of these factors is dispositive
in the Second Circuit. See N.Y. Times Co., 251 F. Supp. 3d at 714 (declining to allow the fourth
factor to automatically prevail over the other three, independently weighing the factors instead).
Nevertheless, Plaintiff satisfies all four factors.

(i) The Public Benefit Derived from the Release of the NMFs

First, the public benefit derived from releasing the NMFs is significant, as it allows
researchers to probe the 2020 Census privacy protection system for bias. Compl. Ex. A at 3 (ECF
No. 1-1) (citing Steven A. Ochoa & Terry Ao Minnis, Preliminary Report: Impact Of
Differential Privacy & The 2020 Census On Latinos, Asian Americans And Redistricting 1-2, 5-6

(April 2021)), https://www.maldef.org/wp-content/uploads/2021/04/FINAL-MALDEF-AAJC-

Differential-Privacy-Preliminary-Report-4.5.2021-1.pdf. Indeed, the Bureau itself has recognized

that the NMFs would be useful for research purposes, given that it decided to release them as
research products.
Access to the NMFs allows scholars like Dr. Phillips to evaluate whether the Census

Bureau is appropriately balancing its dual mandates of producing useful data and protecting
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census respondents’ privacy. Federal law prohibits the Bureau from releasing any information
that reveals the contents of any individual’s census response. 13 U.S.C. § 9(a)(2). To manage
privacy for the 2020 Census, the Bureau introduced a new two-phase algorithm designed to
inject the data with random error to prevent published statistical information from being traced
back to individual respondents. Michael Hawes, Webinar: Differential Privacy 201 and the
Topdown Algorithm (May 13, 2021), transcript available at
https://www?2.census.gov/about/training-workshops/2021/2021-05-13-das-transcript.pdf

Unfortunately, the Bureau’s current privacy-protection method may have unintended
harmful consequences. Professional researchers—including Dr. Phillips—are concerned that
their research has been harmed because the algorithm’s “post-processing” phase may have
systematically inflated the census-reported populations of sparsely populated and homogeneous
areas while shrinking those with greater population density and diversity. See, e.g., Christopher
T. Kenny et al., The Use of Differential Privacy for Census Data and its Impact on Redistricting:
The Case of the 2020 U.S. Census, 7 Sci. Adv. 1, 1 (2021),
https://imai.fas.harvard.edu/research/files/DAS.pdf. This potential distortion in the 2020 Census
would make the data less fit for use in Dr. Phillips’s and other scholars’ research. Further, the
distortion could result in an inequitable distribution of political power and resources, likely
harming racial minority groups. /d.

Before Plaintiff’s litigation, the public had no way to know whether or how much
distortion the post-processing phase added to the decennial census data because the Bureau had
failed to release the intermediate data set that excludes the additional changes made during post-
processing—i.e., the NMFs. Now that Plaintiff’s litigation has caused the Bureau to release the

necessary NMFs, those files can be examined by scholars. Indeed, academics have already
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started publishing analyses of the files. See Christopher T. Kenny et al., Evaluating Bias and
Noise Induced by the US Census Bureau's Privacy Protection Methods, ArVix (2023),
https://arxiv.org/abs/2306.07521. Notably, Dr. Phillips did not participate in this study, further
evidencing the broad uses the data’s release has for the academic community beyond Plaintiff’s
own work.

(ii) The Other Pietrangelo Factors Weigh in Plaintiffs’ Favor

The second and third Pietrangelo factors are often considered together. N.Y. Times Co.,
251 F. Supp. 3d at 713-14. These factors generally favor scholars because “Congress did not
intend for scholars . . . to forgo compensation when acting within the scope of their professional
roles.” Davy, 550 F.3d at 1161. In Kwoka v. International Revenue Service, 989 F.3d 1058, 1062
(D.C. Cir. 2021), the D.C. Circuit found these factors favored a professor who had requested
records to assess whether the IRS fulfilled its FOIA requests in an efficient and effective manner.
The plaintiff’s “serious, scholarly interest” demonstrated by past research and her intent to use
the records to research trends in FOIA requests and propose improvements to agency

(133

administration qualified as the “‘public-interest oriented’ scholarly endeavor that FOIA’s fee
provision exists to encourage.” Id. at 1065. Similarly, Dr. Phillips is a scholar with no
commercial interest in the data. The nature of his interest is academic and public-minded.

The fourth factor also weighs in Plaintiff’s favor. The agency bears the burden to show a
“reasonable basis for not disclosing the material until after the plaintiff filed suit.” Wilson, U.S.
Dist. LEXIS 188389, at *15; see also Davy, 550 F.3d at 1163. The Bureau invoked FOIA
Exemption 3, Stip and Order at 2, which exempts disclosure of records made confidential by

statute, because the Census Act prohibits the publication of data that can be used to identify any

particular establishment or individual. See 13 U.S.C. § 9(a)(2). However, the Bureau’s prior

10
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statements all made clear that the 2020 NMF was privacy protected. See, e.g., Census Bureau,
Disclosure Avoidance for the 2020 Census: An Introduction at 3 (2021) (noting that
“differentially private noise infusion offers quantifiable and provable confidentiality
guarantees”); Hawes, supra, at 4 (statement of Michael Hawes, “the noisy measurement step is
what protects privacy in the algorithm.”); John M. Abowd et al., The 2020 Census Disclosure
Avoidance System TopDown Algorithm, Harv. Data Sci. Rev. at 7, 15 (2022) (explaining the
“Multivariate Discrete Gaussian Mechanism” that ensures that privacy is protected to a
demonstrable degree).

The fact that the 2020 NMF was sufficiently privacy protected was confirmed when
DSEP made its determination in March 2023 that the file could be released. Tellingly, the
Bureau decided to release the recreated 2010 NMF and informed Plaintiff that it was considering
releasing the 2020 NMF just before the Bureau would have been forced to defend its meritless
Exemption 3 theory in summary judgment briefing.

For these reasons, Plaintiff substantially prevailed in the litigation and satisfies all four of
the Pietrangelo factors, making him eligible for and entitled to payment of full attorneys’ fees
and litigation costs under the FOIA.

II. Plaintiff’s Fees and Costs Sought Are Reasonable

The Second Circuit calculates attorneys’ fees based on the “presumptively reasonable
fee” standard. Under this method, courts consider the prevailing hourly rates for legal services in
the district where the case was litigated multiplied by the total hours worked. See Arbor Hill
Concerned Citizens Neighborhood Ass’n v. Cnty. of Albany & Albany Cnty. Bd. of Elections, 522
F.3d 182, 190 (2d Cir. 2008). Courts set reasonable hourly rates based on whether “the requested
rates are in line with those prevailing in the community for similar services by lawyers of

reasonably comparable skill, experience, and reputation.” Blum v. Stenson, 465 U.S. 886, 895

11
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n.11 (1984). Courts may use their discretion also to consider “the complexity and difficulty of
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the case,” “the available expertise and capacity of the client’s [] counsel [],” and “the resources
required to prosecute the case effectively.” Arbor Hill, 522 F.3d at 184; LV v. N.Y. City Dep’t of
Educ., 700 F. Supp. 2d 510, 515 (S.D.N.Y. 2010). The “degree of plaintiff’s success is the ‘most
critical factor’ in determining the reasonableness of a fee award.” People for the Ethical
Treatment of Animals v. Nat’l Institutes of Health, 130 F. Supp. 3d 156, 166 (D.D.C. 2015)
(quoting Farrar v. Hobby, 506 U.S. 103, 114 (1992)).

Plaintiff requests rates that are conservative and more than reasonable, given his
attorneys’ experience levels and the prevailing rates for fee awards in the Southern District of
New York. The requested award is reasonable considering Plaintiff's success in obtaining access
to all of the data he requested pursuant to the FOIA. Accordingly, Plaintiff should be awarded

the requested attorney fees and litigation costs in full.

a. Proposed hourly rates for Plaintiff’s counsel are reasonable.

As documented in their declarations, Plaintiff’s attorneys’ proposed hourly rates are
consistent with their experience level and prevailing rates in the Southern District. Indeed, the
requested rates are conservative. Two of Plaintiff’s attorneys, for example, practice at a
commercial law firm, Selendy Gay Elsberg PLLC, and regularly charge rates well exceeding the
rates sought here.

In New York Times Co. v. CIA, this court granted the plaintiffs their proposed hourly rates
in a FOIA fee award of “$650/hour for a seasoned FOIA litigator with 14 years’ experience and
$400/hour for two junior attorneys.” 251 F. Supp. 3d at 715. Adjusted for inflation from their
reasonableness in May 2017 to July 2023, these comport to rates of $811.90/hour and $499.63
per hour. See Bureau of Labor Statistics, Inflation Calculator,

https://www.bls.gov/data/inflation_calculator.htm. The government did not object to these rates

12
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in New York Times Co. Plaintiff asks for comparable rates. In New York Times Co., the
“seasoned FOIA litigator” had been a lawyer for over 20 years and had spent 14 years litigating
FOIA cases, while the “junior attorneys” had been out of law school for two and three years
respectively. The rates awarded in that case have informed Plaintiff’s request for hourly rates for
the four attorneys that work on this case. Student interns from the Election Law Clinic at
Harvard Law School also contributed many necessary hours to this case, but Plaintiff does not
request a fee award to cover the hours expended by the clinical students. The student hours
expended, for which no fees are sought, reduced the total number of hours expended by the four
attorneys in this action, making the fees sought all the more reasonable.

Jordan Goldstein graduated from Harvard Law School in 2002 and is a founding partner
of Selendy Gay Elsberg PLLC (“SGE”). He is an experienced attorney who specializes in
complex commercial litigation. Declaration of Jordan Goldstein (Aug. 11, 2023) (“Goldstein
Decl.”). Before co-founding SGE, Mr. Goldstein served in several roles in the public and private
sectors, including as a partner at Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP (2010 to 2018);
Special Counsel to the Assistant Attorney General in the National Security Division of the U.S.
Department of Justice (“DOJ”) (2008-2009); Attorney Advisor in the Office of Legal Counsel at
DOJ (2006-2008); and a law clerk to the Honorable Alex Kozinski, U.S. Court of Appeals for
the Ninth Circuit (2005-2006). /d. Plaintiff seeks a rate of $811.90 per hour for Mr. Goldstein’s
work on this case. This rate is well below Mr. Goldstein’s private billing rate and is consistent
with this Court’s application of fees in New York Times Co.

Ruth Greenwood graduated from Columbia Law School in 2009 and has maintained an
active federal litigation practice in the years since then, including numerous voting rights and

redistricting cases that rely on census data, and she was counsel on one FOIA enforcement case

13
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against the Census Bureau in 2020. Declaration of Ruth Merewyn Greenwood (Aug. 11, 2023)
(“Greenwood Decl.”). Plaintiff seeks $686.99 per hour for Ms. Greenwood’s work on this case,
which is reflective of her years of experience and consistent with this court’s award in New York
Times Co.?

Theresa J. Lee graduated from Yale Law School in 2011, and, after clerking for
Rosemary S. Pooler of the United States Court of Appeals for the Second Circuit, spent over 3
years practicing civil litigation in New York, before devoting her practice exclusively to voting
rights and democracy cases in federal and state courts. Declaration of Theresa J. Lee (Aug. 11,
2023) (“Lee Decl.”). Plaintiff seeks $686.99 per hour for Ms. Lee’s work on this case which is
reflective of her years of experience and consistent with this court’s award in New York Times
Co. See supra n.2.

Jeffrey Zalesin is a 2019 graduate of Yale Law School and an associate at SGE, where
his practice focuses on complex commercial litigation. Not including this action, he has worked
on three litigation matters against the Census Bureau, two of which were FOIA actions.
Declaration of Jeffrey Zalesin (Aug. 11, 2023) (“Zalesin Decl.”). Before joining SGE, Mr.
Zalesin clerked for Judge Christopher R. Cooper for the U.S. District Court for the District of
Columbia and worked at the nonprofit Campaign Legal Center, where his practice focused on
election-related litigation. /d. Plaintiff seeks $499.63 per hour for Mr. Zalesin’s work on this
case, which is reflective of his years of experience, in particular with FOIA and census litigation;

well below his private billing rate; and consistent with this court’s award in New York Times Co.

2 Based on the court’s award in New York Times Co., a reasonable rate for an attorney of Ms.
Greenwood and Ms. Lee’s experience would have been $550/hour at that time. Adjusted for
inflation from May 2017 to July 2023 leads to the rate of $686.99 per hour being reasonable
today. See Bureau of Labor Statistics, Inflation Calculator,
https://www.bls.gov/data/inflation_calculator.htm.

14
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As documented in their declarations, Plaintiff’s attorneys’ proposed hourly rates are
consistent with their experience level and prevailing rates in the Southern District of New York.

The Census Bureau’s lack of response to Plaintiff’s Request was successfully combatted
through this litigation. Plaintiff received access to all documents requested in his FOIA Request
and provided the public with important data for evaluating the 2020 Census and improving future
censuses. This degree of success warrants a full award of Plaintiff’s requested hourly rates.

b. Counsel expended reasonable hours in the litigation.

Plaintiff requests $94,729.74 for the attorneys’ hours expended throughout this litigation.
The detailed and contemporaneous time entries accompanying this memorandum of law are
attached as exhibits to the accompanying declarations. See Goldstein Decl., Ex. 1; Greenwood
Decl., Ex. 1; Lee Decl., Ex. 2; Zalesin Decl., Ex. 1. A summary of the total lodestar is attached
as Exhibit 1 to the Lee Declaration. The reasonableness of the hours expended is based on the
time in which the work was performed. See Grant v. Martinez, 973 F.2d 96, 99 (2d Cir. 1992)
(declining to engage in “an ex post facto determination of whether attorney hours were necessary
to the relief obtained”).

Ensuring the Census Bureau complied with Plaintiff’s Request and released the privacy
protected NMFs for both the 2020 Census and the demonstration data from the 2010 Census
required the full amount of time expended by his attorneys. The public release of the 2010 NMF,
which had previously been deleted, showed that Plaintiff’s litigation was a successful catalyst for
the Bureau’s recreation and subsequent release of this data. The Bureau’s incorrect assertion that
the 2020 NMF was exempt from disclosure unnecessarily extended this litigation. Accordingly,
the Bureau should be responsible for the accrued attorneys’ fees and costs from the full course of

this litigation.
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c. Total fees incurred

Under the presumptively reasonable fee standard, the total hours worked multiplied by
each attorney’s hourly fee is $94,729.74. See Arbor Hill, 522 F.3d at 190; Lee Decl., Ex. 1
(summary of lodestar records of each attorney).

d. Total costs incurred

Plaintiff is entitled to recover costs pursuant to the FOIA. Pietrangelo, 586 F.3d at 343
(awarding recovery of costs incurred during a FOIA action). Plaintiff incurred total costs in the
amount of $649.70 in certified mail and filing fees in this action. Lee Decl., Ex. 3. He is entitled
to recover that full amount.

CONCLUSION

For the reasons explained above, Plaintiff respectfully requests an award of $95,379.44 in
attorneys’ fees and costs.

Dated: August 11, 2023

Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Jordan A. Goldstein

Jordan A. Goldstein

Jeffrey Zalesin

SELENDY GAY ELSBERG PLLC
1290 Avenue of the Americas
New York, NY 10104

(212) 390-9000
jeoldstein@selendygay.com
jzalesin@selendygay.com

/s/ Theresa J. Lee

Theresa J. Lee

Ruth Greenwood*

ELECTION LAW CLINIC
HARVARD LAW SCHOOL

6 Everett Street, Ste. 4105
Cambridge, MA 02138

(617) 496-0370
thlee@law.harvard.edu
rgreenwood@law.harvard.edu

* Admitted pro hac vice
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EXHIBIT 1
Plaintiff’s Fees and Costs Summary
FEES
Name Law school year | Hourly Rate | Hours Total
Jordan Goldstein 2002 $811.90 6.0 $4,871.40
Ruth Greenwood 2009 $686.99 40.1 $27,548.30
Theresa Lee 2011 $686.99 49.9 $34,280.80
Jeff Zalesin 2019 $499.63 56.1 $28,029.24
Total Fees $94,729.74
COSTS

Certified mailing $47.70

Filings $602.00

Total Costs $649.70

TOTAL FEES AND COSTS

$95,379.44
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EXHIBIT 2
Plaintiff’s Attorney Theresa Lee Time Entry Ledger
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Date Description Time
5/31/22 Meet with J Phillips re FOIA request 0.6
6/2/22 Edit FOIA request 1.1
6/7/22 Emails with J Phillips and co-counsel re FOIA request 0.5
6/8/22 Edit FOIA request and co-counsel agreement; email J Zalesin re same; e- 1.2
mail J Phillips re draft FOIA
6/15/22 Edit FOIA request 0.8
6/17/22 Edit FOIA request; email co-counsel re same 1.3
6/28/22 Finalize FOIA request; email co-counsel re same; email J Phillips re same | 1.6
7/7/22 Finalize and submit FOIA request; update client re same 2
8/26/22 Email co-counsel re grant of fee waiver and request to expedite 0.4
8/29/22 Email J Phillips re FOIA status 0.3
9/8/22 Video call with co-counsel re next steps 0.5
9/22/22 Review draft motion to expedite; review email to Census Bureau 0.7
9/22/22 Meet with team re case plan, next steps 1
9/29/22 Video call with team re draft complaint 1
9/29/22 Review memorandum re experts 0.7
9/29/22 Review draft complaint 1.2
10/6/22 Video call with team re revisions to complaint and next steps 0.9
10/13/22 Video call with team re complaint and plan for filing 1
10/13/22 Edit draft complaint 1.4
10/14/22 Review memorandum re authority to expedite 0.7
10/20/22 Video call with team re revised complaint, filing plan, possible motionto | 1
expedite

10/20/22 Review materials for filing 0.8
10/26/22 Review memorandum re discovery; revised complaint draft 1
10/27/22 Video call with team re filing, motion papers, revisions 1
10/27/22 Review co-counsel edits to motion to expedite 0.3
10/30/22 Finalize complaint and filing materials 1.1
10/31/22 Review SDNY ECF rules; file complaint and originating documents 1.2
10/31/22 Communicate with V Miller re summonses, service of the complaint 0.6
11/2/22 Emails with co-counsel re Census Bureau statement 0.3
11/3/22 Meet with J Phillips re case update; w counsel team re next steps 0.6
11/4/22 Communicate with V Miller re address for service; revise service affidavit | 0.4
11/8/22 File affidavits of service for complaint and R Greenwood PHV 0.5
11/10/22 Video call with team re next steps, case strategy 0.7
11/17/22 Video call with team re case plan, memos re discovery 1
11/17/22 Review letter from Census Bureau 0.4
11/17/22 Draft responsive letter to Census Bureau 0.6
11/18/22 Review memorandum re discovery motion 0.9
12/1/22 Meet with team re case management plan, research Qs 0.5
12/1/22 Review denial letter from Census Bureau, email team re same 0.2
12/2/22 Email J Phillips re FOIA denial 0.2
12/2/22 Meet with counsel team re FOIA denial and next steps 0.6
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12/8/22 Video call with counsel team re Case Mgmt Order 1
12/8/22 Review draft letter to Chambers 0.4
12/9/22 Video call with J Phillips re case update, discovery 0.3
12/12/22 Meet and confer with Defendants counsel re discovery 0.6
12/12/22 Edit Joint Rule 26(f) report; email R Greenwood, J Zalesin re same 0.3
12/13/22 Review 26(f) report; emails with R Greenwood and J Zalesin re same; call | 0.3
with R Greenwood re same; e-mail AUSA re same
12/13/22 Finalize and file 26(f) Report 0.4
12/15/22 Team meeting re court conference, discovery 0.4
12/15/22 Research re discovery in FOIA cases 0.6
12/19/22 Prep call with J Zalesin, R Greenwood, J Goldstein 1
12/20/22 Counsel team call re next steps 0.3
12/20/22 Team de-brief; case planning 0.3
1/11/23 Team call 0.3
1/18/23 Call with USAOQO; debrief call w counsel team 0.5
1/19/23 E-mail with co-counsel re response to USAO 0.1
1/23/23 Team call re communication from opposing counsel, case status 0.8
1/25/23 Meet-and-confer with J Vargas; debrief counsel call 0.7
1/25/23 Team call with M Altman 0.5
1/25/23 Team call re case status 0.4
1/26/23 Review SDNY ECF events; file law student appearance; email co-counsel | 0.6
re same
1/30/23 E-mail case team communication from chambers re schedule 0.1
1/30/23 Review email to USAO 0.1
2/1/23 Team meeting re case status 0.2
2/15/23 Counsel team call re next steps 0.6
2/27/23 Review and comment on draft MSJ 1.1
3/1/23 Team call re FOIA request and MSJ 0.9
3/8/23 Team meeting re next steps 0.3
3/10/23 Review D Herndon email to USAO; communicate w R Greenwood re 0.2
same
3/29/23 Team meeting re potential resolution 0.7
4/3/23 Revise MSJ and MOL ISO MSJ 0.8
4/4/23 Meet-and-confer w USAO re data release; internal debrief convo 0.6
4/5/23 Call w J Phillips; team call re next steps and MSJ 0.6
4/8/23 Review and edit stipulation; email counsel team re same 0.4
4/10/23 Call USAQ; call chambers; file Stipulation and Order of Dismissal 04
4/19/23 Team meeting re fees, wrap up 0.3
Total 49.9
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EXHIBIT 3

Receipts for Fees and Costs

Fees and Costs

‘$ 402.00 HFiling Fee for Complaint ‘
‘$ 200.00 HFee for Pro Hac Vice of Ruth Greenwood ‘
$47.70 ||Cost for Certified Mail of Complaint |
$ 649.70 [Total |
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Receipt for $402: Filing Fee for Complaint

FW: Pay.gov Payment Confirmation: NEW YORK © « « »
SOUTHERN DISTRICT COURT

@ @ Lee' Theresa J. <th|ee@|awu. Monday, October 31, 2022 at 9:55 AM

To: @ Miller, Veniece; Greenwood, Ruth

Receipt for Filing Phillips v. US Census Bureau.

Theresa J. Lee | she/her

Litigation Director & Clinical Instructor
Election Law Clinic, Harvard Law School

(617) 496-0370 | thlee@law.harvard.edu | hlselectionlaw.org

From: do_not reply@psc.uscourts.gov <do not_reply@psc.uscourts.gov>
Date: Monday, October 31, 2022 at 9:40 AM
To: Lee, Theresa J. <thlee@law.harvard.edu>

Subject: Pay.gov Payment Confirmation: NEW YORK SOUTHERN DISTRICT
COURT

Your payment has been successfully processed and the details are below. If you have

any questions or you wish to cancel this payment, please contact: Helpdesk at 212-
805-0800.

Account Number: 4157271

Court: NEW YORK SOUTHERN DISTRICT COURT
Amount: $402.00

Tracking Id: ANYSDC-26892526

Approval Code: 02847Z

Card Number: **¥****¥xx**6541

Date/Time: 10/31/2022 09:40:11 ET

NOTE: This is an automated message. Please do not reply
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Receipt for $200: Fee for Pro Hac Vice of Ruth Greenwood

Tuesday, November 1, 2022 at 11:38:27 Eastern Daylight Time

Subject: Pay.gov Payment Confirmation: NEW YORK SOUTHERN DISTRICT COURT
Date: Monday, October 31, 2022 at 9:01:47 PM Eastern Daylight Time
From: do_not_reply@psc.uscourts.gov

To: Greenwood, Ruth

Your payment has been successfully processed and the details are below. If you have any questions or you
wish to cancel this payment, please contact: Helpdesk at 212-805-0800.

Account Number: 5725739

Court: NEW YORK SOUTHERN DISTRICT COURT
Amount: $200.00

Tracking 1d: ANYSDC-26898438

Approval Code: 00350Z

Card Number: ¥*¥*¥x*x*x*xg54]

Date/Time: 10/31/2022 09:01:40 ET

NOTE: This is an automated message. Please do not reply
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Receipts for Combined Total of $47.70: Cost for Certified Mail of
Complaint

UNITED STATES
Pkl FOSTAL SERVICE.
HARVARD SQUARE
125 MOUNT AUBURN ST STE 1

CAMBRIDGE, MA 02138-9998
(800)275-8777

11/01/2022 03:39 PM
Product Qty Unit Price
Price
Priority Mail® i $9.90
Flat Rate Env
Suitland, MD 20746
Flat Rate
Expected Delivery Date
Thu 11/03/2022
Cert}fied Mail® $4.00
$2.00
$15.90
'y Ma $9.90
Rate Env
ew York, NY 10007
lat Rate
wpected Delivery Date
Z Thu 11/03/2022
Certified Mail® $4.00
Tracking #:
el 702204100000660383%5
~ e-Raturn Receipt $2.00

ction #: 440
\000000025010801 Contactless
AN EXPRESS



Case 1:22-cv-09304-JSR Document 21-2 Filed 08/11/23 Page 14 of 14

P UNITED STATES
POSTAL SERVICE,

HARVARD SQUARE
125 MOUNT AUBURN ST STE 1
CAMBRIDGE, MA 02136-9998

(800)
110472022 b 05:23 PM

Product Qty Unit Price
e Price
ViMalle o s 9.90
Rate Env ¢
ashington, DC 20233
Rate

xpected Delivery Date
S ‘Mon 11/07/2022 '
Certitied failo $4.00

Tracking
: 70220410000066038362
8 - e-Return Receipt $2.00
. Total $15.90
SRl $15.90
 Credit Card Remlt $15.90

Card Name: AMEX

Account #: XXXXXXXXXXX1004
Approval #: 828726

Transaction #: 841

ID: A000000025010801 Contactless
L: AMERICAN EXPRESS

inqufry on
T (E]ectronic)

: ¢2USPS)

E§§;|V You may aiso
om USPS Tracking or call
-222-1811,

Dol Da%iimn Danaint (bu enail), V151t
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UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
SOUTHERN DISTRCIT OF NEW YORK

JUSTIN H. PHILLIPS,

Plaintiff,
v No. 22-cv-09304-JSR
UNITED STATES BUREAU OF THE CENSUS,

Defendant.

DECLARATION OF JORDAN A. GOLDSTEIN IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF’S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES

I, Jordan A. Goldstein, am over the age of 18 and competent to make this declaration.
Pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746 and the laws of the United States, I state the following:

1. I am a member of the law firm Selendy Gay Elsberg PLLC (“SGE”) and one of the
attorneys for Plaintiff Justin H. Phillips in the above-captioned case. I submit this declaration based

on personal knowledge, in support of the Plaintiff’s application for attorneys’ fees.

Counsel’s Billing Records

2. I have attached my time records for the prosecution of the FOIA proceeding as
Exhibit 1. These time sheets are based on contemporaneous records and, in an effort to make a
reasonable demand, do not include the work spent preparing this fee application. I undertook 6.0
hours of work in this case for which Plaintiff is seeking to recover fees, as reflected in Exhibit 1. I
believe the 6.0 hours I expended were reasonable and necessary for the success of this case.

3. The work that Plaintiff’s counsel have performed to date, and for which Plaintiff

seeks to recover its costs and reasonable attorneys’ fees, includes, among other tasks: drafting
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pleadings and other court documents, preparing for and attending status conferences with Judge
Rakoff, settlement negotiations, preliminary work with experts in advance of motion for summary
judgment, and communications with Plaintiff.
4. Plaintiff does not seek to recover fees for time spent litigating this fee application.
5. The hourly rates sought for my work ($811.90 per hour) and Jeffrey Zalesin’s
work ($499.63 per hour) in this matter are significantly lower than the rates SGE regularly
charges for my time and for Mr. Zalesin’s time, respectively.

Jordan A. Goldstein’s Qualifications

6. I concurrently received my J.D. from Harvard Law School and my M.B.A. from
Harvard Business School in 2002.

7. I am one of the founding partners of SGE, which was established in 2018. 1
currently serve as a Partner and General Counsel of SGE. My practice at SGE focuses on complex
commercial disputes in federal and state courts and before arbitral tribunals. I frequently litigate
on behalf of both plaintiffs and defendants. I have extensive experience conducting trials and
litigating in appellate courts.

8. Before co-founding SGE, I worked as a Partner at Quinn Emanuel Urquhart &
Sullivan, LLP (2010 to 2018); Special Counsel to the Assistant Attorney General in the National
Security Division of the U.S. Department of Justice (“DOJ”) (2008); Attorney Advisor in the
Office of Legal Counsel at DOJ (2006-2008); Law Clerk to the Honorable Alex Kozinski, U.S.
Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit (2005-2006); and Associate at Wachtell, Lipton, Rosen &
Katz (2002-2005).

9. Representative matters that I have litigated in private practice include, among many

others, Federal Housing Finance Agency v. Nomura Holding America, Inc., 1:11-cv-06201
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(S.D.N.Y.) (served as trial counsel in a one-month trial in the Southern District of New York, in
which the Federal Housing Finance Agency obtained an $800 million judgment, as well as
attorneys’ fees, from Nomura and RBS based on findings the investment banks had made false
statements to Fannie Mae and Freddie Mac in offering materials for residential mortgage-backed
securities); Knox County Pension & Retirement Board v. Allianz Global Investors US LLC, Index
No. 651233/2021 (N.Y. Sup. Ct.) (represented mutual fund shareholders who purchased, sold, or
liquidated mutual fund shares managed by Allianz Global Investors U.S. LLC’s Structured
Property Groups from January 1, 2015, to December 31, 2020, securing a $145 million settlement);
and Kearny Investors S.A.R.L. v. Goldman Sachs & Co., 16-cv-09566 (S.D.N.Y.) (action against
multiple investment banks based on alleging violations of federal and state securities laws arising
from the issuance of SunEdison securities).

10. I am admitted to practice before several federal courts, including the U.S. District
Court for the Southern District of New York and the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Second Circuit.
I have been admitted pro hac vice in numerous other courts.

11. I was admitted to the New York State Bar (Bar No. 4154316) on June 20, 2003,
and remain in good standing. I was admitted to the Florida Bar (Bar No. 1030913) on September
21, 2021, and remain in good standing.

12.  Ihave not been disciplined by any state or federal bar and there are no disciplinary

proceedings pending against me as a member of the bar in any jurisdiction.

Exhibits
13.  Attached to this Declaration is a true and accurate copy of Exhibit 1 — my detailed

time records in this matter.

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.
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Executed on this 11th day of August, 2023,

By:

Z

Jordan A. Goldstein



Case 1:22-cv-09304-JSR Document 21-3 Filed 08/11/23 Page 5 of 6

EXHIBIT 1
Plaintiff’s Attorney Jordan Goldstein Time Entry Ledger
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UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
SOUTHERN DISTRCIT OF NEW YORK

JUSTIN H. PHILLIPS,

Plaintiff,
v No. 22-cv-09304-JSR
UNITED STATES BUREAU OF THE CENSUS,

Defendant.

DECLARATION OF RUTH MEREWYN GREENWOOD IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFE’S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES

I, Ruth Merewyn Greenwood, am over the age of 18 and competent to make this

declaration. Pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746 and the laws of the United States, I state the following:

1. I am the Director of the Election Law Clinic at Harvard Law School, and one of the
attorneys for Plaintiff Dr. Justin H. Phillips in the above-captioned case. I am admitted to practice
in this Court on a pro hac vice basis. I submit this declaration based on personal knowledge, in

support of the Plaintiff’s application for attorneys’ fees and costs.

Counsel’s Billing Records

2. I attach my time records for the prosecution of the FOIA proceeding as Exhibit 1.
These time sheets are based on contemporaneous records and, in an effort to make a reasonable
demand, do not include the work spent preparing this fee application. I undertook 40.1 hours of
work in this case for which Plaintiff is seeking to recover fees, as reflected in Exhibit 1. I believe

the 40.1 hours I expended were reasonable and necessary for the success of this case.
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3. The work that Plaintiff’s counsel have performed to date, and for which Plaintiff
seeks to recover its costs and reasonable attorney’s fees, includes, among other tasks: drafting
pleadings and other court documents, preparing for and attending status conferences with Judge
Rakoff, settlement negotiations, preliminary work with experts in advance of motion for summary
judgment, and communications with Plaintiff.

4, Plaintiff does not seek to recover fees for time spent litigating this fee application.

Ruth Greenwood’s Qualifications

5. I graduated with an LL.B (Hons I) / B.Sc. (Hons I) from the University of Sydney
in 2005. I received my LL.M from Columbia Law School in 2009 and was a Harlan Fiske Stone
Scholar. I was admitted to the New York State Bar (Bar. No. 4947966) on June 21, 2011 and
remain in good standing. I was admitted to the Illinois State Bar (Bar No. 6310903) on May 9,
2013 and remain in good standing. I was admitted to the Bar of the Commonwealth of
Massachusetts (Bar No. 707247) on January 6, 2021 and remain in good standing. I am also
admitted to practice before the United States Supreme Court, the United States Court of Appeals
for the Seventh, Eighth, Ninth, and Eleventh Circuits, and the United States District Courts for the
District of Colorado, the District of Massachusetts, and the Northern District of Illinois. I have
been admitted pro hac vice to a number of other state and federal courts. I have not been disciplined
by any state or federal bar and there are no disciplinary proceedings pending against me as a
member of the bar in any jurisdiction.

6. In 2006, directly after graduating from law school in Sydney, I worked as a clerk
(called a “tipstaff” in Australia) for the Hon. Justice R.P. Austin of the Supreme Court of New

South Wales. For two years (2007, the first half of 2008, and the latter half of 2009), I worked as
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a solicitor in the litigation department of the law firm now called Allens Linklaters (then called
Allens Arthur Robinson).

7. I have worked in voting rights and redistricting law and advocacy since 2009. I
worked as a foreign trained attorney with what is now called the Fair Elections Project from
December 2009 until March 2011. During that time, | worked on voting rights advocacy projects
in multiple states including writing a report Lose Your Home, Keep Your Vote (2010) about the
possible effect of the foreclosure crisis on disenfranchisement in the 2010 elections. I then worked
as a Redistricting Fellow with the Democratic National Committee’s Voting Rights Institute from
April 2011 to November 2012. That role included drafting multiple pre-litigation memos for
possible redistricting lawsuits, assisting with briefing for the plaintiffs in Obama for America v.
Husted, 697 F.3d 423 (6th Cir. 2012), and running the preparation for and implementation of
Election Day 2012 voter protection efforts in New Hampshire.

8. From 2013—2016, [ worked at the Chicago Lawyers’ Committee, where I first
worked as a voting rights attorney and fellow, and then served as Lead Counsel for Voting Rights.
[ managed the organization’s Voting Rights Program, including voting rights and redistricting
advocacy and litigation. In this role, I ran the organization’s Election Protection program, which
helped voters with questions about voting and applicable election law in Illinois. I worked on a
number of redistricting matters at the Chicago Lawyers’ Committee, including serving as co-
counsel for Plaintiffs in Whitford v. Gill, a case challenging Wisconsin’s state assembly map as an
unconstitutional partisan gerrymander. 1 also successfully represented a group of residents
challenging the City of Blue Island’s ward map as violﬁting the federal constitution, resulting in a
new ward map that complied with Section 2 of the Voting Rights and the constitution. In 2014, 1

was awarded an Exceptional Service Award by the Chicago Board of Elections for my work on
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Chicago Democracy Week. In 2016, I was a Civic Leadership Academy Fellow with the
University of Chicago. From 2014 to 2015, I also served on the board of the nonpartisan, nonprofit
Prison Policy Initiative. From 2015-2016, I also served as a board member for the Independent
Map Amendment organization, which sought to establish an independent redistricting commission
in Illinois.

9. In 2016, 1 joined the Campaign Legal Center (“CLC”) as Senior Redistricting
Counsel, where my work focused on redistricting and voting rights litigation and advocacy. [ was
then promoted to serve as a Co-Director of Voting Rights and Redistricting. In both of these roles,
I served in a supervisory capacity. While at CLC, I worked on a range of complex redistricting
litigation, including continuing to serve as co-counsel in Whitford v. Gill at both the trial and
appellate phases of the case, including at the U.S. Supreme Court and on remand to the federal
district court. I also served as co-counsel for Plaintiffs in League of Women Voters of North
Carolina, v. Rucho, which challenged North Carolina’s congressional map as an unconstitutional
partisan gerrymander, at both the trial and appellate levels. I also represented Plaintiffs at the pre-
trial gnd trial phases in Holloway v. City of Virginia Beach, a challenge to Virginia Beach’s City
Council districts under Section 2 of the Voting Rights Act. In 2020, I served as co-counsel to
Plaintiffs in Miller v. Thurston and Sinner v. Jaeger, cases challenging signature requirements
during the COVID pandemic for redistricting ballot initiatives in Arkansas and North Dakota. 1
presented oral arguments in the Miller case at the Western District of Arkansas and the Eighth
Circuit. Finally, I also served as counsel on a FOIA enforcement lawsuit involving the Census
Bureau, Campaign Legal Center v. Bureau of the Census, No. 8:20-cv-625 (D. Md. filed Mar. 6,

2020).
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10. While at CLC, I also helped draft amicus briefs and/or served as amici counsel in a
number of voting rights and redistricting cases, including Benisek v. Lamone (federal challenge to
Maryland’s congressional map as an unconstitutional partisan gerrymander); Corman v. Torres
(federal challenge to remedial Pennsylvania congressional map); Hooker v. Illinois State Board of
Elections (Illinois state supreme court challenge involving a redistricting ballot initiative petition),
for which co-counsel and I won the Green Bag Award for Exemplary Legal Writing in 2016;
League of Women Voters of Pennsylvania v. Commonwealth of Pennsylvania (Pennsylvania state
supreme court case challenging state map as an unconstitutional partisan gerrymander); In the
Matter of Title, Ballot Title, and Submission Clause for Proposed Initiative 2017-2018 #69 et al
(series of Colorado state supreme court cases involving a challenge to ballot initiatives relating to
state legislative and congressional redistricting); and Cockrum v. Trump (case involving a
challenge under 42 U.S.C. § 1985(3)). I have also consulted on and helped draft language for
numerous redistricting legislation and policies across the country, including independent
redistricting commissions and state voting rights acts.

11.  While working at CLC, I also served as an Adjunct Professor of Law at Loyola
University Chicago School of Law from 2014-2019, where 1 taught Election Law. From 2020-
2021, I served as a Lecturer in Law at Harvard Law School, where I taught the Voting Rights
Litigation and Advocacy externship clinic.

12, InJuly 2021, I joined Harvard Law School full-time as Visiting Assistant Clinical
Professor of I.aw and the Founding Director of the Election Law Clinic at Harvard Law School
(“ELC”). In that role I serve as counsel for plaintiffs in a racial gerrymandering case, Jacksonville

Branch of the NAACP v. City of Jacksonville, No. 3:22-cv-493 (M.D. Fl filed May 3, 2022), and I
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served as counsel for plaintiffs in a mandamus action related to redistricting and elections, Staples
v. DeSantis, No. 2021-CA-1781 (Fla. Cir. Ct. filed Oct. 15, 2021).

13.  AsDirector of the ELC I have also helped draft amicus briefs and/or served as amici
counsel in a number of voting rights and redistricting cases, including: Johnson v Wisconsin
FElections Commission, No. 2021-AP-1450 (Wis. filed Aug. 23, 2021) (case determining the state
legislative and congressional redistricting plans for the 2020 decade), West Virginia v.
Environmental Protection Agency, No. 20-1530 (U.S. filed Apr. 29, 2021) (dealing with, inter
alia, the non-delegation doctrine), Harper v. Hall, No. 413P21 (N.C. filed Dec. 6, 2021) (North
Carolina Supreme Court case alleging partisan gerrymandering), Alpha Phi Alpha Fraternity v.
Raffensperger, No. 1:21-cv-5337 (N.D. Ga. filed Dec. 30, 2021) (vote dilution claim under Section
2 of the Voting Rights Act), Allen v. Milligan, No. 21-1087 (U.S. filed Jan 28, 2022) (vote dilution
claim under Section 2 of the Voting Rights Act), Moore v. Harper, No 21-1271 (U.S. filed Feb.
25, 2022) (case dealing with whether the independent state legislature theory is a defense against
State Supreme Courts striking down redistricting plans as partisan gerrymanders), Portugal v.
Franklin County, No. 21-250210-11 (Wash. Super. Ct. filed Apr. 22, 2021) and No. 100999-2
(Wash. filed June 8, 2022) (case dealing with the constitutionality of the Washington Voting
Rights Act), Borja v. Nago, No. 22-16742 (9th Cir. filed Nov. 8, 2022) (case alleging absentee
voting rule in Hawaii is a violation of the Fourteenth Amendment), League of Women Voters of
Utah v. Utah State Legislature, No. 20220991-SC (Utah filed Feb. 28, 2023) (partisan
gerrymandering claim under the state constitution).

14. I have written or co-authored a number of academic articles and chapters on the
topic of voting rights and redistricting including: Voting Rights Federalism, Emory Law Journal

(2024 Forthcoming), Voting Under State Law, Oxford Handbook of American Election Law (2024
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Forthcoming), Fair Representation in Local Government, 5 Ind. J.L.. & Soc. Equality 197 (2017);
Return of the States, 40 N.Y.U. Rev. L & Soc. Change 97 (2015).

15. [n addition to formal academic writing, I have also written a number of reports and
articles relating to voting rights and redistricting. Some examples include The Color of
Representation: Local Government in lllinois (2015); Partisan Gerrymandering in 2016: More
Extreme Than Ever Before (2016); Make Democracy Count: Ending Partisan Gerrymandering
(2016); Designing Independent Redistricting Commissions (2018); and Designing State Voting
Rights Acts: A Guide to Securing Equal Voting Rights for People of Color and a Model Bill (2020).
In addition, I have spoken to numerous groups and panels across the country on various voting

rights and redistricting topics.

Exhibits
16.  Attached to this Declaration is a true and accurate copy of Exhibit 1 — my detailed

time records in this matter.
[ declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.
Executed on this] 1th day of August, 2023,

B

Ruth Merewyn Greenwood
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EXHIBIT 1
Plaintiff’s Attorney Ruth Greenwood Time Entry Ledger
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Date Description Time
2/15/22 | Email w client about case 0.3
2/16/22 | Draft co-counsel and retainer agreement to send to ELC and S&G team | 0.5
2/16/22 | Research past FOIA examples to give to students for drafting assistance | 0.5
9/21/22 | Discuss draft complaint with student 0.3
9/21/22 | Review email asking for update on status 0.2
9/22/22 | Meet with team to discuss follow up with Census Bureau and review 1.0
draft complaint and motion to expedite
9/22/22 | Email with J Bissasor about motion to expedite 0.1
9/23/22 | Draft Meeting notes and circulate 0.3
9/23/22 | Communicate w N Tang re possible expert list to investigate 0.1
9/29/22 | Discuss draft complaint 0.7
9/30/22 | Review email to client re experts 0.1
10/3/22 | Edit complaint, leave some comments for next reviewer 1.5
10/6/22 | Meet with team re editing complaint 0.9
10/7/22 | Meet with possible experts for case, update team with notes 1.5
10/13/22 | Meet with team re: upcoming filing 1.0
10/19/22 | Review complaint and motion to expedite, leave comments 1.0
10/19/22 | Review email on cert of service and local rules, review local rules 0.2
10/20/22 | Meet with team re: complaint filing and motion to expedite 1.0
10/21/22 | Draft and send email to client to update on status 0.3
10/27/22 | Meet with J Zalesin and team re: final details of case filing plan 1.0
10/31/22 | Email client with filed copies 0.1
11/3/22 | Meet with team re next steps on exemptions research, experts, and 1.0
discovery research
11/7/22 | Discuss Judge Rakoff with T Lee and J Zalesin 0.2
11/10/22 | Meet with team and J Zalesin: case status and strategy 0.6
11/14/22 | Meet with opposing counsel, discuss possible motion to expedite 0.4
11/14/22 | Email team re call with opposing counsel 0.2
11/30/22 | Email team re census response upcoming 0.2
12/7/22 | Research into NARA 0.7
12/8/22 | Research into discovery motion and possible defenses 4.8
12/8/22 | Draft 26f dates and email team 0.3
12/8/22 | Team meeting to discuss 26f conference 1.0
12/8/22 | Draft letter to send complaint to judge 0.3
12/9/22 | Research memo for student to do on FOIA and discovery cases 0.3
12/11/22 | Update dates for 26f 0.3
12/15/22 | Team meeting 0.7
12/16/22 | Draft memo on bureau claims of privacy in publications 2.5
12/19/22 | Review hearing notes by J Zalesin add comments 0.5
12/20/22 | 26 f conference 0.4
12/20/22 | Post hearing debrief 0.5
12/20/22 | Emails to experts 0.5
1/11/23 | Email to expert re expert report 0.1
1/11/23 | Call with J Zalesin re: next steps 0.3
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Date Description Time
1/18/23 | Call with opposing counsel, then follow up with co-counsel about 1.0
schedule

1/23/23 | Team meeting re J Vargas email 0.7
1/23/23 | Draft email to J Vargas 0.3
1/23/23 | Send email to J Vargas 0.1
1/23/23 | Email to team about J Vargas email and update client 0.6
1/25/23 | Pre meet and confer convo w T Lee 1.0
1/25/23 | Meet and confer 0.8
1/25/23 | Post meet and confer discussion w J Zalesin and T Lee and D Herndon | 0.3
1/26/23 | Teleconference with Judge's chambers to change dates 0.5
1/26/23 | Meet with expert and then team to discuss next steps on case 1.0
2/1/23 Weekly meeting to discuss next steps on MSJ and FOIA follow up 0.5
2/1/23 Meet with expert re next steps on case 0.5
2/15/23 | With clinic team re: drafting motion for summary judgment 0.6
3/8/23 Meet with team 0.3
4/3/23 Review TPs for call on Tues 0.2
4/3/23 Review and edit MSJ 1.5
4/4/23 Meet and confer with J Vargas 0.6
4/6/23 Review MSJ memo and edit, circulate to co-counsel 0.8
4/6/23 Review email from J Vargas 0.1
4/7/23 Discuss finalizing MSJ docs 0.3
Total 40.1
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UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
SOUTHERN DISTRCIT OF NEW YORK

JUSTIN H. PHILLIPS,

Plaintiff,
v No. 22-cv-09304-JSR
UNITED STATES BUREAU OF THE CENSUS,

Defendant.

DECLARATION OF JEFFREY ZALESIN IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF’S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES

I, Jeffrey Zalesin, am over the age of 18 and competent to make this declaration. Pursuant

to 28 U.S.C. § 1746 and the laws of the United States, I state the following:

1. I am an associate at the law firm Selendy Gay Elsberg PLLC (“SGE”) and one of
the attorneys for Plaintiff Justin H. Phillips in the above-captioned case. I submit this declaration

based on personal knowledge, in support of the Plaintiff’s application for attorneys’ fees and costs.

Counsel’s Billing Records

2. I attach my time records for the prosecution of the FOIA proceeding as Exhibit 1.
These time sheets are based on contemporaneous records and, in an effort to make a reasonable
demand, do not include the work spent preparing this fee application. I undertook 56.1 hours of
work in this case for which Plaintiff is seeking to recover fees, as reflected in Exhibit 1. I believe
the 56.1 hours I expended were reasonable and necessary for the success of this case.

3. The work that Plaintiffs counsel have performed to date, and for which Plaintiff

secks to recover its costs and reasonable attorneys’ fees, includes, among other tasks: drafting
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pleadings and other court documents, preparing for and attending status conferences with Judge
Rakoff, settlement negotiations, preliminary work with experts in advance of motion for summary
judgment, and communications with Plaintiff.

4, Plaintiff does not seek to recover fees for time spent litigating this fee application.

Jeffrey Zalesin’s Qualifications

5. I received my J.D. from Yale Law School in May 2019. While in law school, I
participated as a student intern in the Rule of Law Clinic (“ROLC”) and was a member of a ROLC
team that represented the National Association for the Advancement of Colored People
(“NAACP”) and certain of its affiliates in two litigation matters concerning the 2020 Census:
NAACP v. U.S. Dep’t of Commerce, 3:17-cv-01682 (D. Conn.) (FOIA action), and NAACP v.
Bureau of the Census, 8:18-cv-00891 (D. Md.) (action under the Constitution and Administrative
Procedure Act).

6. From 2019 to 2020, I served as a Legal Fellow at Campaign Legal Center (“CLC”).
My practice at CLC was devoted to litigation and public advocacy regarding the 2020 Census,
redistricting, voting rights, and campaign finance. Some of the litigation on which I worked at
CLC, like the present action, involved claims under FOIA. The litigation matters on which I
worked at CLC include Campaign Legal Center v. Bureau of the Census, 8:20-cv-00625 (D. Md.)
(FOIA action); Campaign Legal Center v. Federal Election Commission, 1:19-cv-02336 (D.D.C.)
(action challenging dismissal of administrative complaint regarding alleged violations of campaign
finance law); Holloway v. City of Virginia Beach, 2:18-cv-0069 (E.D.V.A.) (Voting Rights Act
action); Raysor v. Lee, 4:19-cv-00301 (N.D. F1.) (challenge to Florida law requiring payment of
certain financial obligations as condition of restoration of voting rights to individuals with felony

convictions); League of Women Voters of Tennessee v. Hargett, 3:19-cv-385 (M.D. Tenn.)
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(challenge to Tennessee law restricting voter registration activities); and League of Women Voters
of Minnesota v. Simon, 20-cv-01205 (D. Minn.) (challenge to certain restrictions on voting by mail
in Minnesota during COVID-19 pandemic).

7. From 2020 to 2021, I served as a Law Clerk to the Honorable Christopher R.
Cooper of the United States District Court for the District of Columbia.

8. Since 2021, I have served as an Associate at SGE. My practice at SGE focuses on
complex commercial disputes in federal and state courts and before arbitral tribunals.
Representative matters on which I have worked at SGE include Deutsche Bank Securities Inc. v.
Kingate Global Fund Ltd., 19-cv-10823 (S.D.N.Y.) and Fortis Advisors LLC v. Johnson &
Johnson, C.A. No. 2020-0881-LWW (Del. Ch.). I also maintain an active public-interest practice
focused on voting rights and redistricting. In addition to representing Plaintiff in the instant action,
I represented the American Bar Association as amicus curiae in Moore v. Harper, 21-1271, a case
before the Supreme Court concerning redistricting and elections.

9. I am admitted to practice before the U.S. District Court for the Southern District of
New York, the U.S. District Court for the Eastern District of New York, and the U.S. District Court
for the District of Columbia. I have been admitted pro hac vice in certain other courts, including
the U.S. District Court for the District of Maryland and the Delaware Court of Chancery.

10. I was admitted to the District of Columbia bar (Bar. No. 1671482) on December
27, 2019, and remain in good standing. I was admitted to the New York State Bar (Bar. No.
5936513) on January 18, 2022, and remain in good standing.

11.  Ihave not been disciplined by any state or federal bar and there are no disciplinary

proceedings pending against me as a member of the bar in any jurisdiction.
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Exhibits
12.  Attached to this Declaration is a true and accurate copy of Exhibit 1 — my detailed

time records in this matter.
I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed on this 11th day of August, 2023,

Jeffrey Zalesin



Case 1:22-cv-09304-JSR Document 21-5 Filed 08/11/23 Page 5 of 8

EXHIBIT 1
Plaintiff’s Attomey Jeffrey Zalesin Time Entry Ledger
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